
  
 CITY OF RIVERSIDE 
 PURCHASING DIVISION 
 
 Bid Results of Wednesday August 23, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6425 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Sedgwick Ave & 12 St Sewer Est.Amt:   $162,585.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Albert Davies .....................................................................................................$224,052.00 
2. Savala Const. .....................................................................................................$228,115.25 
3. Genesis Const. ...................................................................................................$245,777.00 
4. Ken Thompson...................................................................................................$266,511.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday August 16, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6420 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Buchanan Booster Station Est.Amt:   $680,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Cass Construction ..............................................................................................$805,430.00 
2. Cora Construction ..............................................................................................$810,200.00 
3. Pascal & Ludwig................................................................................................$850,540.00 
4. Genesis Const. ...................................................................................................$865,777.00 
5. TC Const. ...........................................................................................................$877,860.00 
6. Norman A Olsson Const .................................................................................$1,293,900.00 
 
Bid No.        6426 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Monroe St. Improvements Est.Amt:   $3,300,356.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Riverside Const...............................................................................................$2,800,376.00 
2. Griffith Co.......................................................................................................$2,911,623.00 
3. KEC Eng .........................................................................................................$2,970,835.50 
4. LA Eng............................................................................................................$3,139,914.00 
5. MTM Const.....................................................................................................$3,744,000.00 
6. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$3,944,750.00 
 
Bid No.        6393 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Evergreen Cemetery Est.Amt:   $1,106,224.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sully Miller .....................................................................................................$1,716,000.00 
2. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$1,725,719.00 
3. Alliance Streetworks.......................................................................................$1,806,433.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday August 9, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6414 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Runway 9/27 & Taxiway Est.Amt:   $5,000,000.00 
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Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Vance Corp .....................................................................................................$3,878,878.30 
2. Griffith Co.......................................................................................................$5,192,803.80 
3. Adams Mallory Const .....................................................................................$5,340,985.60 
4. Construction Testing & Engineering ................................................... Non-Responsive Bid 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday August 2, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6422 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         One utility Bed Service Trucks Est.Amt:   $50,642.50 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sunrise Ford.........................................................................................................$40,272.71 
2. Moss Motors Ford................................................................................................$41,889.02 
3. Raceway Ford ......................................................................................................$44,067.00 
4. Trans West Truck.................................................................................................$44,816.86 
5. Reynolds Buick....................................................................................................$45,205.52 
6. Lake Chevrolet.....................................................................................................$45,349.82 
7. Boerner Truck Ctr ......................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6405 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Center Street Ext St & Sewer Imprvmts Est.Amt:   $2,277,114.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Riverside Construction ...................................................................................$1,949,167.00 
2. McKenna Eng .................................................................................................$1,998,821.30 
3. Sully Miller Contracting Co. ..........................................................................$2,006,000.00 
4. Vance Corp .....................................................................................................$2,126,995.00 
5. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$2,188,884.00 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday July 26, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6417 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Battery Back-up System Est.Amt:   $ 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Clary Corp..........................................................................................................$205,167.00 
 
 
Bid No.        6395 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Third Floor Ext Glass Wall Exp Est.Amt:   $110,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Thomco Const. ...................................................................................................$284,996.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday July 19, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6374 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Railroad Crossing Project-Phase II Est.Amt:   $1,100,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
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1. Genesis Const. ................................................................................................$1,348,777.00 
2. Albert Davis ....................................................................................................$1,434,433.00 
3. T.A. Rivard .....................................................................................................$1,858,600.00 
 
Bid No.        6419 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Annual Requirement for Traffic Paint Est.Amt:   $100,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Dispensing Tech ................................................................................................$226,081.05 
2. Visions Recycling ......................................................................................................No Bid 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday July 12, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6415 Time:        1:30   P.M. 
Project:         Installation of Carpet Squares Est.Amt:   $40,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Contract Carpet ....................................................................................................$22,942.10 
2. Mike’s Custom Flooring......................................................................................$58,900.00 
3. Lambert Ent .........................................................................................................$59,997.00 
 
Bid No.      6370 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:       University Ave Widening Est.Amt:   $2,217,491.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Hillcrest Contractors .......................................................................................$2,330,417.27 
2. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$2,843,746.35 
 
Bid No.      6362 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:      Van Buren Blvd Street Improvements Est.Amt:   $237,285.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sully Miller ........................................................................................................$268,000.00 
2. Hardy & Harper .................................................................................................$303,969.00 
3. Oak Engineering ................................................................................................$322,377.00 
4. Alliance ..............................................................................................................$338,524.50 
 
 
Bid No.        6411 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Five Tilt Trailers Est.Amt:   $150,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. West Trucks .......................................................................................................$109,274.66 
2. Johnson Machinery ............................................................................................$119,063.75 
 
Bid No.        6412 Time:        3:00   P.M. 
Project:        2 Current Model Ramp Trailers Est.Amt:   $15,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
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1. Johnson Machinery ..............................................................................................$21,149.17 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Bid No.        6398 Time:        3:15   P.M. 
Project:        Van Buren Blvd. Street Imprvmts Est.Amt:   $10,013,108.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sully Miller .....................................................................................................$8,893,917.20 
2. Shawnan........................................................................................................$10,878,128.00 
3. Riverside Construction .................................................................................$10,882,230.90 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday July 5, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6409 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Police Uniforms & Acces Est.Amt:   $170,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Galls West..........................................................................................................$180,980.46 
2. Woodcrest Uniforms..........................................................................................$226,264.39 
 
Bid No.        6413 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        Carpet Tiles & Adhesives Est.Amt:   $161,625.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Contract Carpet ................................................... with 5% local preference      $149,804.30 
2. Mikes Custom Flooring .....................................................................................$154,578.36 
 
Bid No.        6418 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Printing of Monthly Svcs Statement Est.Amt:   $63,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Advanced Business Graphics...............................................................................$28,029.01 
2. FPC Graphics .......................................................................................................$34,497.24 
3. Valley Printer Inc.................................................................................................$43,029.36 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday June 28, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6399 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Alessandro Booster Station Replacement Est.Amt:   $1,407,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. SCW Contracting ............................................................................................$1,263,135.70 
2. So Cal Pacific Const. ......................................................................................$1,426,000.00 
3. Cora Constructors ...........................................................................................$1,463,000.00 
4. Caliagua Inc ....................................................................................................$1,568,426.00 
5. Adams Mallory Const .....................................................................................$1,762,702.00 
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Bid No.        6407 Time:        3:00   P.M. 
Project:        Concrete Svc Trucks Est.Amt:   $65,225.00/each 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Lake Chevrolet...................................................................................................$108,872.76 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday June 21, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6354 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        Monroe Street Widening at SR91 Est.Amt:   $136,786.50 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Paveco Construction Inc. ...................................................................................$160,252.62 
2. Alliance Streetworks..........................................................................................$208,011.50 
3. Imperial Paving..................................................................................................$210,789.00 
 
Bid No.        6397 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Ramona Water Main Replcmt Est.Amt:   $1,435,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. TA Rivard .......................................................................................................$1,540,076.00 
2. Special Service Const. ....................................................................................$1,633,748.00 
3. Choctaw Cont..................................................................................................$1,639,808.00 
4. J. Fletcher........................................................................................................$1,689,479.00 
5. Genesis Const. ................................................................................................$1,838,777.00 
6. EJ Meyer .........................................................................................................$1,858,888.00 
7. CP Const .........................................................................................................$1,887,338.00 
8. Miramontes .....................................................................................................$2,289,144.00 
 
Bid No.        6375 Time:        3:00   P.M. 
Project:        Andulka Park Phase 2 Est.Amt:   $1,503,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Hal Hays Const. ..............................................................................................$1,445,425.00 
2. Hillcrest Const. ...............................................................................................$1,798,250.00 
3. Riverside Const...............................................................................................$1,867,500.00 
4. Megaway Ent. .................................................................................................$1,969,000.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday June 7, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6385 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Delano Drive Sewer Repairs Est.Amt:   $334,450.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Southwest Pipe...................................................................................................$328,949.00 
2. Sancon Technologies .........................................................................................$332,518.00 
 
Bid No.        6404 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Annual-Tire Recapping Est.Amt:   $55,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
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1. Daniel’s Tire ........................................................................................................$56,447.35 
2. Parkhouse Tire .....................................................................................................$59,583.66 
3. Eagle Road Svc ....................................................................................................$60,027.21 
4. Torelli Tire ...........................................................................................................$61,304.21 
5. Pete’s Road Svc ...................................................................................................$63,219.20 
 
Bid No.        6406 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Static Tandem Asphalt Roller Est.Amt:   $50,400.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Raincross Eng ......................................................................................................$49,834.00 
2. Nixon Egli............................................................................................................$56,348.94 
3. Johnson Machinery ....................................................................................................No Bid 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday May 31, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6394 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Andulka Park 12” Water Main Relocation Est.Amt:   $55,600.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. David Wasden......................................................................................................$89,625.00 
 
Bid No.        6403 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        One Current Model CNG Street Sweeper Est.Amt:   $210,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Kelly Equipment ................................................................................................$240,807.00 
2. Haaker Equipment .............................................................................................$243,360.91 
 
Bid No.        6401 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Automated Refuse Containers Est.Amt:   $320,017.50 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Cascade Eng.......................................................................................................$237,600.00 
2 Rehrig Pacific Co...............................................................................................$259,679.66 
3. Schaffer Systems................................................................................................$271,083.92 
4. Toter Inc.............................................................................................................$272,771.28 
5. Otto Environmental Systems .............................................................................$273,353.13 
6. Roto Industries ...................................................................................................$293,834.25 
7. Ameri-Kart.........................................................................................................$340,382.25 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday May 24, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6264 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Alessandro Blvd. Imprvmts Arlington to Trautwein Est.Amt:   $7,340,712.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. All American Asphalt .....................................................................................$9,137,827.52 
2. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$9,939,247.47 
3. RJ Noble .......................................................................................................$10,602.080.38 
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4. Sully Miller ...................................................................................................$11,088,189.56 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday May 17, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6379 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Traffic Signals Van Buren/Trautwein Est.Amt:   $87,100.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Republic Electric..................................................................................................$61,800.00 
2. CSI Electrical .......................................................................................................$76,952.00 
3. Terno, Inc.............................................................................................................$79,118.00 
4. Steiney & Co........................................................................................................$81,476.00 
 
Bid No.        6389 Time:        3:00   P.M. 
Project:        Arlington Branch Library Est.Amt:   $4,500,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Perera Const. ...................................................................................................$4,259,000.00 
2. Soltek Pacific ..................................................................................................$4,347,000.00 
3. RC Const. ........................................................................................................$4,350,000.00 
4. Tovey/Shultz Const.........................................................................................$4,558,000.00 
5. GC Builders ....................................................................................................$4,890,000.00 
6. Gamut Const. ..................................................................................................$4,924,000.00 
7. Mepco Services...............................................................................................$5,532,000.00 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday May 10, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6386 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Traffic Signal/Lighting at Intersections Est.Amt:   $81,890.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Terno ..................................................................................................................$158,990.00 
2. Sierra Pacific......................................................................................................$201,786.16 
3. Steiny & Co. ......................................................................................................$219,305.55 
4. EE Electric .................................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6289 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Freeway Beautification on Interstate Hwy Est.Amt: $231,199.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. CS Legacy..........................................................................................................$234,959.00 
2. Sol Construction ................................................................................................$265,763.00 
3. Landmark Site Cont ...........................................................................................$304,037.00 
 
Bid No.        6383 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        Traffic Signals at Columbia & Magnolia Ave Est.Amt: $185,330.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sierra Pacific......................................................................................................$226,593.00 
2. DBX ...................................................................................................................$233,502.00 
3. Terno ..................................................................................................................$246,877.00 
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4. Republic Electric................................................................................................$262,800.00 
5. Steiny & Co. ......................................................................................................$264,054.00 
6. EE Electric .................................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6380 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        University Ave 12” Water Main Replcmt Est.Amt: $830,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. J. Fletcher Creamer & Sons ...............................................................................$720,785.00 
2. David Wasden....................................................................................................$807,420.00 
3. TA Rivard .......................................................................................................$1,282,720.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday May 3, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6378 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Minor Street Rehab 2005-06, Phase I&II Est.Amt: $2,919,080.50 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Sylvia Construction.........................................................................................$3,126,635.50 
2. All American Asphalt .....................................................................................$3,285,000.00 
3. Excel Paving. ..................................................................................................$3,350,660.00 
4. RJ Noble..........................................................................................................$3,418,171.70 
 
Bid No.        6390 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Station Uniforms for the Fire Department Est.Amt: $150,850.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Greenwoods Uniform.........................................................................................$152,204.42 
 
Bid No.        6391 Time:        3:00   P.M. 
Project:        Athletic Clothing for the Fire Department Est.Amt: $150,850.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Galls (An Aramark Co.).......................................................................................$43,302.04 
2. Creative Images ...................................................................................................$64,315.97 
3. Greenwoods Uniforms. ........................................................................................$73,512.43 
 
 Bid Results of Wednesday April 26, 2006 
Bid No.        6371 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Victoria Ave Median Improvments Est.Amt: $1,730,121.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Shawnan..........................................................................................................$1,462,929.90 
2. Environmental Const. .....................................................................................$1,588,176.61 
3. Sol Const.........................................................................................................$1,710,549.10 
 
Bid No.        6382 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Trackless MT Series V Municipal Tractor Est.Amt: $150,850.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Snoquip Inc. .......................................................................................................$135,705.74 
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2. Work Equipment ................................................................................................$142,728.61 
3. Edward R Bacon Co...........................................................................................$147,570.09 
4. Westrux ......................................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6388 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        One (1) or More Used 17-Tn Stinger Crane Trk Est.Amt: $161,625.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. GPE Pacific Equipment .....................................................................................$138,109.64 
 
Bid No.        6384 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Safety Clothing Est.Amt: $60,000.00/yr 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. All Star Fire Equipment .....................................................................................$144,407.95 
2. Firefighter .....................................................................................................Incomplete Bid 
3. LN Curtis & Son ...........................................................................................Incomplete Bid 
4. Long Beach Uniforms...................................................................................Incomplete Bid 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday April 19, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6345 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Arlington Ave 12, 16, 20” Water Transmission Main Est.Amt: $1,300,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Trautwein Construction ..................................................................................$1,071,300.00 
2. Weka Inc .........................................................................................................$1,217,737.00 
3. CP Const. ........................................................................................................$1,330,517.00 
4. Genesis Const. ................................................................................................$1,430,777.00 
5. TA Rivard .......................................................................................................$1,631,823.00 
  
Bid No.        6381 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         1 Ea Current Model Chevrolet Suburban Est.Amt: $75,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Lake Chevrolet.....................................................................................................$69,445.96 
2.  Boerner Truck Center ................................................................................................No Bid 
 
 Bid Results of Wednesday April 12, 2006 
Bid No.        6353 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Replacement Gazebo & Picnic Shelters Est.Amt: $447,970.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Hal Hays Const. .................................................................................................$535,530.00 
2. Delt Builders ......................................................................................................$553,000.00 
3. Mega Way Ent ...................................................................................................$559,500.00 
4. Cora Construction ..............................................................................................$608,000.00 
5. Conengr..............................................................................................................$644,000.00 
6. Lambard Ent.......................................................................................................$681,999.00 
7. 4-Con Eng ..........................................................................................................$695,550.00 
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Bid No.        6369 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Wood Road Sewage Pump Station Upgrade Est.Amt: $1,266,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. SCW Contracting ............................................................................................$1,249,000.00 
2. Cora Constructors ...........................................................................................$1,281,554.00 
3. Stanek Const. ..................................................................................................$1,284,000.00 
4. Vadnais Corp ..................................................................................................$1,368,000.00 
5. Bonadiman McCain ........................................................................................$1,369,389.00 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday April 5, 2006 
Bid No.        6367 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:        Installation of Traffic Signals & Lighting Systems Est.Amt: $400,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. New West Signal................................................................................................$434,206.00 
2. Sierra Pacific......................................................................................................$435,220.00 
3. DBX Inc. ............................................................................................................$486,938.00 
4. Steiny & Co., Inc. ..............................................................................................$506,400.10 
5. TDS Eng.............................................................................................................$540,074.00 
6. Terno, Inc...........................................................................................................$573,929.00 
7. Herman Weissker.......................................................................................................No Bid 
8. EE Electric .................................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6376 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Demolition & Lot Clearing Merrill Ave Est.Amt: $35,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Woody’s Demo ....................................................................................................$33,500.00 
2. Vizion’s West.......................................................................................................$37,750.00 
3. Warren Duncan ....................................................................................................$40,650.00 
4. Midwest Environmental.......................................................................................$44,109.00 
5. Andy Neumann ....................................................................................................$47,000.00 
6. Nat’l Demolition Cont .........................................................................................$66,811.00 
7. Dakeno, Inc. .........................................................................................................$70,811.00 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday March 29, 2006 
Bid No.        6377 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         1 Ea 2-passenger Electric Vehicle Est.Amt: $9,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Long Beach Chrysler ......................................................................................... $11,460.29 
2. Star Chrysler/Jeep ................................................................................................$12,217.07 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday March 22, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6372 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Various Emergency Equipment for 32 Patrol Vehicles Est.Amt: $188,928.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Woodcrest Vehicle Center .................................................................................$227,413.16 
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2. 911 Vehicle ........................................................................................................$347,516.24 
 
Bid No.        6373 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Forklift Est.Amt: $55,021.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Select Equipment .................................................................................................$44,331.49 
2. Komatsu ...............................................................................................................$46,427.32 
3. Meyers Forklift ....................................................................................................$58,987.73 
4. Johnson Lift .........................................................................................................$75,097.44 
5. Yale Chase .................................................................................................................No Bid 
 
Bid No.        6364 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Scanning of Documents for Substation Eng Est.Amt: $125,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Matrix Imaging ..................................................................................................$113,835.04 
2. Eplotting.............................................................................................................$114,000.00 
3. PSG ....................................................................................................................$123,963.75 
4. EcoPro, Inc.........................................................................................................$124,176.00 
5. ATI Inc...............................................................................................................$126,852.40 
6. Konica/Minolta ..................................................................................................$138,972.68 
7. Convert-A-Doc ..................................................................................................$183,670.98 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday March 15, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6343 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Curb, Gutter & Sidewalk Repair 05/06 Est.Amt: $905,400.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. CS Legacy..........................................................................................................$797,141.00 
2. CJ Concrete........................................................................................................$860,800.00 
3. S. Parker Eng .....................................................................................................$969,940.00 
4. Silvia Const.....................................................................................................$1,058,300.00 
5. Kalban Inc.......................................................................................................$1,399,075.00 
 
Bid No.        6368 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Fire Station No. 14 Est.Amt: $3,400,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. RC Construction .............................................................................................$3,581,000.00 
2. Tovey/Schultz .................................................................................................$3,683,000.00 
3. Erickson-Hall ..................................................................................................$3,748,000.00 
4. Gamut Const. ..................................................................................................$3,759,000.00 
 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday March 8, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6359 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         Security Services Park & Rec Est.Amt: $101,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
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1. All American Private Security Inc.....................................................................$139,219.08 
2. A Security Max..................................................................................................$155,555.40 
3. Big Wills Security Service.................................................................................$240,240.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday March 1, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6363 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Alessandro Booster Station Est.Amt: $1,180,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. MCC................................................................................................................$1,263,000.00 
2. Margate Const.................................................................................................$1,297,500.00 
3. Cora Construction ...........................................................................................$1,457,578.00 
4. So Cal Pacific..................................................................................................$1,497,900.00 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday February 22 2006 

 
Bid No.        6366 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         La Sierra Area Sewer Phase II Est.Amt: $3,067,975.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
          Alt 1             Alt 2 
1. Utah Pacific Const. ............................................................... $2,542,144.00; $2,542,144.00 
2. SJ & B Group........................................................................ $2,589,604.00; $2,602,004.00 
3. Trautwein Const.................................................................... $2,611,910.00; $2,615,550.00 
4. Chactaw Const ...................................................................... $2,642,321.00; $2,642,761.00 
5. Genesis Const. ...................................................................... $3,068,650.00; $3,078,930.00 
6. JR Pipeline Co. ..................................................................... $3,141,965.00; $3,190,945.00 
7. Bubalo Const......................................................................... $3,235,825.00; $3,262,625.00 
8. Miramontes ........................................................................... $3,271,675.00; $3,290,635.00 
9. Vido Artukovich & Sons ...................................................... $3,299,800.00; $3,319,960.00 
10. EJ Meyer ............................................................................... $3,533,333.00; $3,494,444.00 
11. SRD Eng ............................................................................... $3,705,636.00; $3,771,876.00 
12. Highland Eng ........................................................................ $3,910,743.09; $4,098,605.69 
13. Southwest Eng ...................................................................... $3,917,950.00; $3,971,550.00 
14. TA Rivard ............................................................................. $4,101,795.00; $4,111,795.00 
15. Ken Thompson...................................................................... $4,521,889.00; $4,331,749.00 
16. Mladen Buntich..................................................................... $4,795,098.00; $4,917,498.00 
 
Bid No.        6365 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:         2005/2006 Street Rehab Est.Amt: $237,815.00.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Alliance Streetworks..........................................................................................$320,897.90 
2. Silvia Const........................................................................................................$328,074.00 
3. Hardy & Harper .................................................................................................$362,908.00 
4. All American Asphalt ........................................................................................$363,363.00 
5. EBS Inc. .............................................................................................................$376,948.00 
6. Sully Miller ........................................................................................................$378,000.00 
7. RJ Noble.............................................................................................................$385,983.00 
8. Laird Const. .......................................................................................................$386,683.00 
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Bid No.        6332 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:         Reid Park Expansion Est.Amt: $4,007,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Riverside Const...............................................................................................$6,000,000.00 
2. Mega Way Ent ................................................................................................$6,499,000.00 
3. Los Angeles Eng.............................................................................................$6,506,000.00 
4. WRC ............................................................................................................Incomplete Bid 
 
 

Bid Results of Wednesday February 8, 2006 
 
Bid No.        6344 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Monroe Street Masonry Wall Est.Amt: $220,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. CS Legacy..........................................................................................................$175,849.00 
2. Sol Construction ................................................................................................$236,426.00 
3. Ronald Butkay Const. ........................................................................................$245,900.00 
4. Southland Const. ................................................................................................$265,800.00 
5. Grand Pacific .....................................................................................................$277,319.50 
6. 4-Con Eng ..........................................................................................................$298,800.00 
7. Romero Gen Cont. .............................................................................................$396,346.35 

 
Bid Results of Wednesday February 1, 2006 

 
Bid No.        6329 Time:        2:00   P.M. 
Project:         Maude/Jane Pressure Reducing Valve Station Est.Amt: $156,351.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Bonadiman McCain ...........................................................................................$189,825.00 
2. T.A. Rivard ........................................................................................................$192,610.00 
3. Ross A Guy & Son.............................................................................................$193,089.00 
4. Trautwein Const.................................................................................................$207,995.00 
5. SCW Contracting ...............................................................................................$262,770.00 
6. Genesis Const. ...................................................................................................$296,777.00 
 
Bid No.        6351 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Fire Station No. 6 Est.Amt: $3,300,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Tovey Shultz Const.........................................................................................$3,423,000.00 
2. Gamut Const. ..................................................................................................$3,490,000.00 
3. RC Const. ........................................................................................................$3,529,000.00 
4. Construct 1 One Corp .....................................................................................$3,619,777.00 
5. G-2000 Const. .................................................................................................$3,899,000.00 
6. USS Cal Bldrs .................................................................................................$4,838,000.00 
 
Bid No.        6352 Time:        2:15   P.M. 
Project:        Fire Station No. 13 Est.Amt: $3,200,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
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1. Tovey/Shultz Const.........................................................................................$3,362,228.00 
2. RC Const. ...................................................................Incomplete   Bid          $3,403,000.00 
3. Ericson ............................................................................................................$3,644,000.00 
4. Construct 1 One .............................................................................................$3,750,374.00 
5. Gamut Const. ..................................................................................................$3,827,000.00 
6. PW Const. .......................................................................................................$3,977,000.00 
7. G-2000 Const. .................................................................................................$4,060,000.00 
8. GW Contrctors ................................................................................................$4,444,585.00 
9. USS Cal Bldrs .................................................................................................$4,871,000.00 
 
Bid No.        6355 Time:        2:30   P.M. 
Project:        Rehab 3 Elevators at City Hall Est.Amt: $800,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. Schindler Elevator..............................................................................................$493,243.00 
2. Otis Elevators.....................................................................................................$604,567.00 
 
 
 
 
Bid No.        6349 Time:        2:45   P.M. 
Project:        Installation of Traffic Signal & Lighting Est.Amt: $266,000.00 
Apparent Low Bidder 
 
1. DBX Inc. ............................................................................................................$256,957.10 
2. Sierra Pacific......................................................................................................$309,585.60 
3. Steiny & Co. ......................................................................................................$314,618.90 
4. Moore Electrical ................................................................................................$355,321.00 
5. Dynalectric.........................................................................................................$364,880.00 
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