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NARRATIVE

On 1031 17 at approximately 1226 hours I received an automated message on my phone regarding a full
METRO call out at Castle View Elementary 6201 Shaker Dr Riverside Ca 92508 The message stated to
respond directly to the front of the location and advise dispatch when you are in route to the call I called
dispatch at 1322 hours and advised them I was in route to the location I arrived on scene at approximately
1402 hours and contacted Lieutenant Crawford at the Command Post Lieutenant Crawford advised me a

suspect had battered a teacher and took her into an unoccupied room and was holding her hostage The
suspect was described as a Black male adult tall thin and in possession of two back packs I was told to
respond to building A room 3 and meet up with Sergeant McCoy who was assigned as a secondary React
Team near the primary room Al

I arrived at the room and saw the interior doors of all the rooms in that building led into a common area
React Team 2 was tasked with covering the interior door of the primary location Room Al and possibly
enter into the primary location in the event of a crisis situation I stood by with React Team 2 while Sergeant
McCoy and Sergeant Wilson conducted reconnaissance of room A6 which was immediately next to the
primary location the suspect and hostage were located Room A6 shared a common wall with the primary
room which was partitioned with an accordion style fold in wall Sergeant McCoy decided to move the
secondary React Team to that location because it put us closer to the suspect and the hostage Sergeant Tipre
and Corporal Waldon Corona PD stayed in room A3 to cover the interior door which led into a shared

common area between all the rooms Sergeant Tipre was eventually relieved by Officer Hill and Officer
Zackowski

React Team 2 was now located in room A6 I was attached to this team to assist Sergeant McCoy My
assignment was to serve as the fifth person in line to make entry into the primary room if necessary We
remained in that location while ENT attempted negotiations with the suspect While in the room Sergeant
Wilson utilized a camera to see into the primary room Al I viewed the camera monitor and could see both
doors leading into the room were barricaded with chairs and desks It appeared the suspect had created
several barriers all over the room to delay entry into the location from both entry points Several Times I
could hear the suspect communicate with ENT on the other side of the partitioned wall At one point I heard
coughing which in my opinion sounded like it came from a female which I believed to be the victim While
viewing the monitor I never saw the suspect or the victim however it sounded as if the suspect was just on
the other side of the wall a few feet away from us

Believing the partitioned wall may be our quickest way to enter the room Officers Wilder and Kerr went
into a separate building to learn how to slide open the partitioned walls Both Officers arrived back at our
location and stated the walls were simple to open and it can be done quickly It was believed at that point our
easiest access into the primary location would be to slide open the wall and make entry into the room

After several hours of after negotiations a plan was developed to rescue the hostage from the suspect It was
determined our team React Team 2 would make the entry into the location while the primary React Team
would create diversions to the front of the location

Sergeant McCoy gave the command for the diversions Officers Kerr Wilder and Newton attempted to open
the partitioned wall The wall opened approximately one foot and was stuck on an unknown object Officer
Paes was the first officer on the entry team and I saw he was only able to partially enter the room No other
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team members were able to enter due to the wall being stuck on an unknown object Because of the failed
breach and the time we were spending attempting to open the wall I grabbed the door ram went into the
common area with Officer Hill and Corporal Waldon and attempted to breach the interior door This was
done to possibly create a better entry point and to possibly create another diversion to draw the suspects
attention away from Officer Paes who appeared to be stuck in the small opening of the partitioned wall I
struck the door approximately three times causing the door to open approximately one foot before it struck
the barricades placed behind it I was attempting to push the door open when I heard approximately three gun
shots within close proximity of me coming from inside the room I immediately backed away from the door
and heard Officer Paes yell the suspect still had the hostage I looked back into the room and immediately
saw Officers at the window of the room Fearing a cross fire situation I backed away from the door and went
back into room A6 I saw the victim being run out of our room by an unknown officer and heard Officer Paes
yell the suspect was down It was communicated to the primary React Team for them to make entry because
we were stuck at our location and we were unable to secure the room and suspect React Team 1 entered the
room and secured it I saw one of the tactical medics assigned to theSWATTeam providing medical aid to
the suspect At that point I exited the room and stood by with otherSWATTeam members

I responded to the Magnolia Station and waited for further instruction from investigations While at
Magnolia Station Detectives Smith Anderson and Corbett charted and inventoried my weapons and
magazines I was photographed by Detective Anderson in mySWATuniform and equipment

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

While I was breaching the interior door of the primary location I saw a live rifle round had fallen out of my
magazine which was attached to the magazine inserted in my rifle I did not recover round but left it on
scene by the interior door of room A1


